
TESTER’S COMMENT:
“Despite concerns about the fit – 
particularly the inner sock – these were 
comfortable and supportive to run in. 
Used in mud, water and gravel path on 
which they gripped well. Submerged in 
water they felt comfortable to continue 
running in and my foot felt dry.”

EDITOR’S COMMENT:
It’s imperative that trail shoes offer good 
support as well as keeping feet warm and 
dry, and our testers felt that the All Out 
Terra Trail delivered on all fronts. The inner 
sock provides a snug fit that moulds to the 
foot ,keeping out any debris and leaving 
you free to enjoy an uninterrupted run.
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MERRELL ALL OUT TERRA TRAIL

TESTER’S COMMENT:
“Very impressed by the amount of 
protection this shoe provides given how 
minimal it is. The Vibram sole provides a 
great fit and grip on all off-road surfaces, 
and the shoe’s very lightweight. Superb 
grip, great fit and good construction. 

EDITOR’S COMMENT:
Trail shoes often compromise comfort for 
gnarly traction and durability. Fortunately, 
the All Out Terra Trail does not. Its glove-
like fit makes hitting the trails a pleasure 
and the shoe will stand up to any obstacle 
your off-road pursuits may throw at you.

MERRELL ALL OUT TERRA TRAIL


